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Practical guidelines for an effective implementation of software development processes. Designed to ensure
effective software development processes, the Capability Maturity Model (CMM) - North America's leading
standard for software development - requires companies to complete five steps, or levels, in the development
process. But while it is widely adopted by Fortune 500 companies, many others get stuck at the initial
planning stage. Focusing on Levels 2 and 3 of the CMM, this book helps readers to get over the hurdle of the
two most problematic areas in this process - the project management and software development steps. It
offers clear, step-by-step guidance on how to establish basic project management processes to track costs,
schedules, and functionality; how to document, standardize, and integrate software processes; and how to
improve software quality.
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From reader reviews:

Michael Counts:

Reading a book can be one of a lot of activity that everyone in the world enjoys. Do you like reading book
and so. There are a lot of reasons why people like it. First reading a publication will give you a lot of new
information. When you read a reserve you will get new information due to the fact book is one of various
ways to share the information or perhaps their idea. Second, looking at a book will make an individual more
imaginative. When you reading through a book especially fictional works book the author will bring that you
imagine the story how the people do it anything. Third, it is possible to share your knowledge to other
individuals. When you read this Implementing the Capability Maturity Model, it is possible to tells your
family, friends and soon about yours reserve. Your knowledge can inspire the others, make them reading a
reserve.

Cindy Gross:

Often the book Implementing the Capability Maturity Model has a lot info on it. So when you check out this
book you can get a lot of profit. The book was authored by the very famous author. This articles author
makes some research prior to write this book. That book very easy to read you can find the point easily after
reading this article book.

Stacee Stern:

Are you kind of hectic person, only have 10 as well as 15 minute in your day time to upgrading your mind
proficiency or thinking skill also analytical thinking? Then you are receiving problem with the book than can
satisfy your small amount of time to read it because this all time you only find publication that need more
time to be examine. Implementing the Capability Maturity Model can be your answer because it can be read
by a person who have those short spare time problems.

William Johnson:

Beside this Implementing the Capability Maturity Model in your phone, it can give you a way to get more
close to the new knowledge or information. The information and the knowledge you can got here is fresh
from oven so don't always be worry if you feel like an old people live in narrow town. It is good thing to
have Implementing the Capability Maturity Model because this book offers for you readable information. Do
you often have book but you do not get what it's exactly about. Oh come on, that wil happen if you have this
inside your hand. The Enjoyable option here cannot be questionable, including treasuring beautiful island.
Techniques you still want to miss the item? Find this book along with read it from today!
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